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In the spirit of Anita Diamant’s The Red Tent comes an extraordinary debut novel that breathes life into
Noah’s wife and combines history and mythology in an intensely suspenseful, page-turning narrative.

The young heroine in Sinners and the Sea is destined for greatness. Known only as “wife” in the Bible and
cursed with a birthmark that many think is the brand of a demon, this unnamed woman lives anew through
Rebecca Kanner. The author gives this virtuous woman the perfect voice to make one of the Old Testament’s
stories come alive like never before.

Desperate to keep her safe, the woman’s father gives her to the righteous Noah, who weds her and takes her
to the town of Sorum, a haven for outcasts. Alone in her new life, Noah’s wife gives him three sons. But
living in this wicked and perverse town with an aloof husband who speaks more to God than to her takes its
toll. She tries to make friends with the violent and dissolute people of Sorum while raising a brood that,
despite its pious upbringing, develops some sinful tendencies of its own. While Noah carries out the Lord’s
commands, she tries to hide her mark and her shame as she weathers the scorn and taunts of the townspeople.

But these trials are nothing compared to what awaits her after God tells her husband that a flood is
coming—and that Noah and his family must build an ark so that they alone can repopulate the world. As the
floodwaters draw near, she grows in courage and honor, and when the water finally recedes, she emerges
whole, displaying once and for all the indomitable strength of women. Drawing on the biblical narrative and
Jewish mythology, Sinners and the Sea is a beautifully written account of the antediluvian world told in
cinematic detail.
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From reader reviews:

Betty Terry:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what the ones you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have extra time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that
question simply because just their can do which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person.
Yes, it is correct. Because start from on pre-school until university need that Sinners and the Sea: The Untold
Story of Noah's Wife to read.

Rodolfo Rodgers:

The ability that you get from Sinners and the Sea: The Untold Story of Noah's Wife is a more deep you
looking the information that hide inside the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean
that this book is hard to know but Sinners and the Sea: The Untold Story of Noah's Wife giving you joy
feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by anyone who read
this because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your
personal vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go along with you, both in
printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this Sinners and the Sea: The Untold Story of
Noah's Wife instantly.

David Goodspeed:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to study a book. When you examine a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
kinds of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and
soon. The Sinners and the Sea: The Untold Story of Noah's Wife will give you a new experience in looking
at a book.

James Helm:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This guide Sinners and the Sea: The Untold Story of Noah's Wife was filled with regards to
science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has
diverse feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense
enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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