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Global jihadism has been on policy agendas for more than two decades. Since the 9/11 attacks, both
transnational jihadi entities such as Al-Qaeda and national or regional militant groups have attracted a great
deal of media and scholarly attention. In recent years, policy agendas have increasingly come to include a
focus on countering militant jihadi ideologies. Despite this, studies of global jihadism that take the impact of
ideas seriously are at a relatively early stage and have yet to fully capture the richness of their social contexts
and intellectual universes. Departing from the security studies approaches that have characterised much
writing about jihadi groups, this volume aims to engage policy-makers and specialists alike by bridging
existing disciplines and areas of study to create a framework for beginning to understand jihadi movements
through the study of their ideologies, intellectual histories, political engagements and geographies. The
contributors to the volume come from a range of academic disciplines (including history, anthropology,
political science, religious studies and area studies), as well as from the worlds of diplomacy and policy
research. In addition to studies of globalised contexts and ideologies, the volume also includes detailed
studies of jihadi currents of thought and responses to them in Afghanistan, Yemen, Somalia, India, Pakistan,
Egypt, South-East Asia and Europe.
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From reader reviews:

Sharon Gaines:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that
reserve has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They
are really reading whatever they have because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book after they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will require this Contextualising Jihadi Thought. Jeevan Deol and
Zaheer Kazmi (Eds.).

Madeleine Bandy:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead. Some of
you maybe will update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know which you should start with. This Contextualising Jihadi Thought.
Jeevan Deol and Zaheer Kazmi (Eds.) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why,
as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Adam Perlman:

The book untitled Contextualising Jihadi Thought. Jeevan Deol and Zaheer Kazmi (Eds.) is the e-book that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you.
The language that article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
author was did a lot of study when write the book, hence the information that they share to you personally is
absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Contextualising Jihadi Thought. Jeevan Deol and
Zaheer Kazmi (Eds.) from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Nancy Royals:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get great deal
of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are there
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the particular book you have read
is usually Contextualising Jihadi Thought. Jeevan Deol and Zaheer Kazmi (Eds.).
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