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A MAN STABS HIS GIRLFRIEND TO DEATH, THEN HANGS HIMSELF, LEAVING A NOTE
CONFESSING TO THE MURDER. OPEN AND SHUT CASE? NOT FOR DETECTIVE TYRONE
SWIFT.

Dominic Merrell’s estranged wife Georgie doesn’t believe that he could have done it. Detective Swift
discovers that Dominic was a reliable, devoted husband and father for eighteen years until he met the
beautiful, charismatic Lisa, who he left his wife for. No one can believe that Dominic was capable of murder.
But if it wasn’t him, then who killed the seductive but chaotic Lisa?

Dominic and his murdered girlfriend harbour dark secrets from their turbulent pasts. How can two lovers
cause so much destruction?

Tyrone Swift will do anything to uncover the truth about a case that has uncomfortable parallels to his own
troubled personal life. In a shocking ending, those with much to hide will do anything they can to stop
him.

TWO LOVERS, SIX DEATHS is a beautifully written mystery that will have you gripped from start to
heart-stopping finish.

Perfect for fans of Robert Galbraith, Paula Hawkins, P.D. James, Gillian Flynn, or Ruth Rendell.

THE DETECTIVE

Tyrone Swift is an ex-police detective who now works privately. He’s survived a stabbing and his fiancée
running off with another man. Swift's personal life is complicated. He is still involved with his ex, Ruth, who
is expecting their child, but living with another man. And it’s just about the worst time to begin another
relationship, but he is tempted by the attractive police detective Nora Morrow.

THE SETTING
The streets of London with their vibrant mix of nationalities, cultures, and rich and poor are beautifully
evoked. From the quiet suburbs with their veneer of happy family life, to the bustling centre with refugees
struggling to survive, to exclusive penthouses where the elite can have anything they want day or night.

THE AUTHOR
Gretta is a critically acclaimed author of best-selling detective and literary fiction. 'Mulrooney has a real gift
for dialogue, the words and phrases ring true and make her characters wonderfully real . . . A tenderly funny
and genuinely moving piece. I loved it.’ Fiona Morrow, Time Out (about ARABY) ‘A beautifully observed
study of reconciliation, Araby makes astute points about conflict and shifting values between generations.’
James Eve, The Times
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From reader reviews:

Gloria Eller:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled TWO LOVERS, SIX DEATHS a gripping crime thriller with a huge
twist. Try to face the book TWO LOVERS, SIX DEATHS a gripping crime thriller with a huge twist as your
pal. It means that it can to become your friend when you truly feel alone and beside associated with course
make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you more confidence
because you can know almost everything by the book. So , let me make new experience and knowledge with
this book.

Roger Lee:

The book with title TWO LOVERS, SIX DEATHS a gripping crime thriller with a huge twist includes a lot
of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book
exist new knowledge the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world at
this point. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you
throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can
read this anywhere you want.

Candace Arroyo:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When
you examine a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, as
well as soon. The TWO LOVERS, SIX DEATHS a gripping crime thriller with a huge twist will give you
new experience in studying a book.

Henry Jones:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by internet on social media. You can
choose the most effective book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it.
It is called of book TWO LOVERS, SIX DEATHS a gripping crime thriller with a huge twist. You'll be able
to your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make a person
happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one
destination to other place.
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