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In December 2003, after one of the largest, most aggressive manhunts in history, US military forces captured
Iraqi president Saddam Hussein near his hometown of Tikrit. Beset by body-double rumors and false alarms
during a nine-month search, the Bush administration needed positive identification of the prisoner before it
could make the announcement that would rocket around the world.
            At the time, John Nixon was a senior CIA leadership analyst who had spent years studying the Iraqi
dictator. Called upon to make the official ID, Nixon looked for telltale scars and tribal tattoos and asked
Hussein a list of questions only he could answer. The man was indeed Saddam Hussein, but as Nixon learned
in the ensuing weeks, both he and America had greatly misunderstood just who Saddam Hussein really was.
            Debriefing the President presents an astounding, candid portrait of one of our era’s most notorious
strongmen. Nixon, the first man to conduct a prolonged interrogation of Hussein after his capture, offers
expert insight into the history and mind of America’s most enigmatic enemy. After years of parsing
Hussein’s leadership from afar, Nixon faithfully recounts his debriefing sessions and subsequently strips
away the mythology surrounding an equally brutal and complex man. His account is not an apology, but a
sobering examination of how preconceived ideas led Washington policymakers—and the Bush White
House—astray. Unflinching and unprecedented, Debriefing the President exposes a fundamental misreading
of one of the modern world’s most central figures and presents a new narrative that boldly counters the
received account.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Eva Byrd:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important usually. The book Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of
Saddam Hussein has been making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more
information. It is rather advantages for you. The book Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam
Hussein is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to become your friend when you sense
bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship while using
book Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein. You never really feel lose out for
everything if you read some books.

Mark Hart:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or info even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you is
you don't know which you should start with. This Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam
Hussein is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you
want and want in this era.

James Ronquillo:

This Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein are generally reliable for you who want
to be considered a successful person, why. The reason why of this Debriefing the President: The
Interrogation of Saddam Hussein can be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more
than just simple reading food but feed a person with information that maybe will shock your earlier
knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions in
e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein
forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical
thinking that could it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Richard Mendoza:

Reading a book to get new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to examine a book. When you
study a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well as
soon. The Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein provide you with a new
experience in studying a book.



Download and Read Online Debriefing the President: The
Interrogation of Saddam Hussein John Nixon #2BH431SDVAW



Read Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam
Hussein by John Nixon for online ebook

Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein by John Nixon Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio
books, books to read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book
reviews epub, read books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to
read, top books to read Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein by John Nixon books
to read online.

Online Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein by John Nixon
ebook PDF download

Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein by John Nixon Doc

Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein by John Nixon Mobipocket

Debriefing the President: The Interrogation of Saddam Hussein by John Nixon EPub


