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The Autodesk® Vault Professional 2017 (R1) Essentials student guide provides instructions to features of the
Autodesk® Vault Professional software. The focus of this student guide is Bill of Material (BOM)
management and Engineering Change Order (ECO) process.

This student guide is intended for users with knowledge of all Autodesk Vault Basic and Autodesk Vault
document management features. It focuses on the features of Autodesk Vault Professional pertaining to
BOM and ECOs. Hands-on exercises are included to reinforce usage of items, BOMs, ECOs, and automated
workflows. This student guide also provides you with information about using the Autodesk Vault
Professional software with the AutoCAD® Civil 3D® software, the Autodesk® Revit® software, Thin Client,
Active Directory, Autodesk Buzzsaw (Project Sync), and Replication solutions.

Topics Covered

Introduction to Autodesk Vault Professional●

Working with Items●

Managing Change●

Working with Bills of Materials●

Administering Autodesk Vault Professional●

Reporting●

Working with AutoCAD® Civil 3D●

Working with Autodesk® Revit®
●

Thin Client●

Replication●

Prerequisites
Students should have a good working knowledge of Autodesk CAD programs and have working knowledge
of Autodesk Vault Basic and Autodesk Vault document management features.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Apodaca:

The book Autodesk Vault Professional 2017 (R1) Essentials: Autodesk Authorized Publisher gives you the
sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can
to be your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem along with your subject. If you can
make reading through a book Autodesk Vault Professional 2017 (R1) Essentials: Autodesk Authorized
Publisher for being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your personal capable,
increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You could know everything if you like start and read a
publication Autodesk Vault Professional 2017 (R1) Essentials: Autodesk Authorized Publisher. Kinds of
book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you
think about this publication?

Evelyn Brown:

Here thing why this specific Autodesk Vault Professional 2017 (R1) Essentials: Autodesk Authorized
Publisher are different and reliable to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good but it really depends in
the content of the usb ports which is the content is as tasty as food or not. Autodesk Vault Professional 2017
(R1) Essentials: Autodesk Authorized Publisher giving you information deeper and different ways, you can
find any publication out there but there is no guide that similar with Autodesk Vault Professional 2017 (R1)
Essentials: Autodesk Authorized Publisher. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own eyes
about the thing this happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. You can bring
everywhere like in area, café, or even in your approach home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties
in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Autodesk Vault Professional 2017 (R1) Essentials:
Autodesk Authorized Publisher in e-book can be your option.

Jodi Dunn:

Why? Because this Autodesk Vault Professional 2017 (R1) Essentials: Autodesk Authorized Publisher is an
unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will jolt you
with the secret the idea inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who also write the book
in such awesome way makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey
the meaning fully. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this ever again or you going to
regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have got such as help
improving your talent and your critical thinking way. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I had
been you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Lauren Zavala:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social media.
You can choose the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through searching



from it. It is identified as of book Autodesk Vault Professional 2017 (R1) Essentials: Autodesk Authorized
Publisher. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it could add your
knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about book. It can
bring you from one destination to other place.
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