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A charming sock monkey reunites a fractured family in this simply remarkable novel in the tradition of The
Velveteen Rabbit and The Penderwicks.

Meet Throckmorton S. Monkey. He’s everything a sock monkey is supposed to be: Loving. Loyal. A very
good listener. And he’s never, ever—not even once!—stopped smiling. Yet Throckmorton has been long
forgotten by his keeper Annaliese Easterling, and he seems doomed to live out his days lost and lonely
among other abandoned stuffed animals.

But then one day Great Grand Mama Easterling sends engraved invitations to forty-nine sock monkeys to
attend her ninetieth birthday along with their human keepers. Throckmorton is thrilled! The arrival of his
invitation brings him back together with Annaliese. And he vows to do something so remarkable, so
amazing, she will never want to be separated from him again.

Indeed, over just a few days, Throckmorton will survive being buried in a blizzard. He’ll be spared from a
vicious attacker. But best of all, he’ll find a way to reunite Annaliese with the one person she most longs to
know. Not bad for a stuffed toy—if you’re to believe that’s all Throckmorton S. Monkey really is…
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From reader reviews:

Marcia Ogburn:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a guide. Book
has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Beside
that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication The Secrets of Eastcliff-by-the-Sea: The
Story of Annaliese Easterling & Throckmorton, Her Simply Remarkable Sock Monkey will make you to be
smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think that
will open or reading the book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might be thought like that?
Have you looking for best book or appropriate book with you?

Aida Zambrana:

This The Secrets of Eastcliff-by-the-Sea: The Story of Annaliese Easterling & Throckmorton, Her Simply
Remarkable Sock Monkey is brand-new way for you who has attention to look for some information because
it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or else you
who still having little bit of digest in reading this The Secrets of Eastcliff-by-the-Sea: The Story of Annaliese
Easterling & Throckmorton, Her Simply Remarkable Sock Monkey can be the light food for yourself
because the information inside this specific book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books build itself
in the form that is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in
book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a
reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't
miss that! Just read this e-book sort for your better life as well as knowledge.

Cruz Fleury:

You will get this The Secrets of Eastcliff-by-the-Sea: The Story of Annaliese Easterling & Throckmorton,
Her Simply Remarkable Sock Monkey by browse the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it
could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various.
Not only simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era including
now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your own ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Ryan Barrett:

Book is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen require book to know the change information of year to be able to year. As we know those
books have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. With
the book The Secrets of Eastcliff-by-the-Sea: The Story of Annaliese Easterling & Throckmorton, Her
Simply Remarkable Sock Monkey we can consider more advantage. Don't that you be creative people?



Being creative person must like to read a book. Only choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't
be doubt to change your life by this book The Secrets of Eastcliff-by-the-Sea: The Story of Annaliese
Easterling & Throckmorton, Her Simply Remarkable Sock Monkey. You can more pleasing than now.
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