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At the height of the Cold War and the Second Red Scare, when McCarthyism and fear of nuclear holocaust
is at its worst, murder draws a small Midwestern Iowa town into the craze of Soviet spy rings on US soil and
government-sponsored communist witch-hunts. In one of the coldest winters on record, Jimmy Novotny is
trying to deal with his own personal demons after returning home from the Korean War to Belle Plaine,
Iowa, and finds himself embroiled in the investigation of several puzzling deaths. He works to solve the
mystery, not just to get at the truth, but to prove himself worthy of the task – worthy of anything after the
horrors he left behind in the war. Working with him – or perhaps against him – is the beautiful redheaded
reporter from Cedar Rapids, Cecilia Brom. She carries secrets of her own. And then there are others
following their own agendas, each making the investigation for the truth increasingly difficult and
dangerous. The question remains, is Jimmy Novotny up to the challenge, or will the Cold War freeze him
out, leaving a murderer to escape unpunished? Is there anyone he can really trust to help him get to the
bottom of it before more people die?
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From reader reviews:

Freddie Valdez:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading
book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot
of new data. When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of numerous
ways to share the information as well as their idea. Second, reading a book will make a person more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially fiction book the author will bring that you imagine the
story how the people do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other folks. When you
read this Cold War: Murder in the Heartland, you can tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours
publication. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a e-book.

Donna Graham:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Cold War: Murder in the Heartland guide
written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book which might be understand by
anyone who all read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and producing skill only
for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still question Cold War: Murder in the Heartland as good
book not merely by the cover but also with the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book
by its handle, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your studying
sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.

Sophie Clark:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much easier
to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is Cold War: Murder in the Heartland this reserve consist a lot of the information with
the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how does the world has grown up. The
words styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some analysis when he
makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.

Margaret Pace:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is named of book Cold War:
Murder in the Heartland. You can include your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it might
add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about book. It
can bring you from one spot to other place.
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