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In this beautifully illustrated book, Maureen Carroll examines the most recent evidence of the existence of
ancient gardens, the horticultural practices used to plant and maintain them, and the many forms and
functions they assumed. Surveying the ancient Near East, Egypt, Greece, Italy, and the provinces of the
Roman Empire from the second millennium B.C. to the middle of the first millennium A.D., Carroll finds
that whether grown as sources of food, symbols of wealth and prestige, or dwellings for the gods, the
cultivation of gardens played an integral role in both the public and private spheres of the ancient world. She
concludes with a chapter on the survival of ancient gardening traditions in the Islamic and Byzantine worlds
and the ways in which gardens have figured in these cultures' perceptions and depictions of paradise.
Culling evidence from a wide variety of archaeological, textual, and pictorial sources, and illustrated with
delightful images from tomb and wall paintings, sculptural reliefs, manuscripts, and reconstructions, Carroll
provides fascinating insights into the earthly paradises of antiquity.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Kier:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and
the resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information especially this Earthly Paradises: Ancient Gardens
in History and Archaeology book because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in
this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Betty Blake:

The book untitled Earthly Paradises: Ancient Gardens in History and Archaeology contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy approach. The language is very
easy to understand all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was
compiled by famous author. The author will bring you in the new period of time of literary works. You can
actually read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or product, so you can read the
book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open up their official
web-site and order it. Have a nice learn.

Ana Jimenez:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and Earthly Paradises: Ancient
Gardens in History and Archaeology as well as others sources were given expertise for you. After you know
how the truly great a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or
perhaps students especially. Those guides are helping them to include their knowledge. In other case, beside
science book, any other book likes Earthly Paradises: Ancient Gardens in History and Archaeology to make
your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Cliff Boyd:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. In
this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching
for the Earthly Paradises: Ancient Gardens in History and Archaeology when you required it?
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