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This volume of poems was published first in German by Rowohlt and has now been translated into three
other languages and illustrated beautifully by the artist and poet Christoph Meckel. Concise and extremely
visual, these poems are almost as if they are hewn into stone. The translations appear side by side and open
up Hein's individual poetic world even better than many an interpretation might. The illustrations for the
cover and each of the five cycles in the book increase the book's aesthetic value. This volume is a part of new
series from The Vigdis Finnbogadottir Institute dedicated to mulitlingual publication. The 25 poems are
translated into English, Icelandic, Danish, in addition to the original German.
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From reader reviews:

Leta Welter:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This Between Winter and Winter book is readable by means of you who hate the
perfect word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without
leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer associated with Between
Winter and Winter content conveys thinking easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book
are not different in the articles but it just different available as it. So , do you still thinking Between Winter
and Winter is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Eric Overbay:

This Between Winter and Winter tend to be reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person,
why. The key reason why of this Between Winter and Winter can be one of many great books you must have
is giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you with information that maybe will shock
your prior knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your
conditions both in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Between Winter and Winter giving you an
enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we know it
useful in your day task. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Keith Cochran:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your limited time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to be
study. Between Winter and Winter can be your answer mainly because it can be read by anyone who have
those short free time problems.

Anne Hernandez:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Between Winter and Winter can be the response, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your free time by reading in this new era
is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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