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Holograms have been in the public eye for over a half-century, but their influences have deeper cultural
roots. No other visual experience is quite like interacting with holograms; no other cultural product melds the
technological sublime with magic and optimism in quite the same way. As holograms have evolved, they
have left their audiences alternately fascinated, bemused, inspired or indifferent. From expressions of high
science to countercultural art to consumer security, holograms have represented modernity, magic and
materialism. Their most pervasive impact has been to galvanise hopeful technological dreams.

Engineers, artists, hippies and hobbyists have played with, and dreamed about, holograms. This book
explores how holograms found a place in distinct cultural settings. It is aimed at readers attracted to pop
culture, visual studies and cultural history, scholars concerned with media history, fine art and material
studies and, most of all, cross-disciplinary audiences intrigued about how this ubiquitous but still-mysterious
visual medium grew up in our midst and became entangled in our culture.

This book explores the technical attractions and cultural uses of the hologram, how they were shaped by
what came before them, and how they have matured to shape our notional futures. Today, holograms are in
our pockets (as identity documents) and in our minds (as gaming fantasies and 'faux hologram' performers).
Why aren't they more often in front of our eyes?
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Lyon:

The publication with title Holograms: A Cultural History posesses a lot of information that you can find out
it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This specific book exist new understanding the information
that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to be
aware of how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you with new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you
want.

Calvin Lee:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Holograms: A Cultural History reserve
written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who
read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking every ideas and composing skill only for
eliminate your hunger then you still hesitation Holograms: A Cultural History as good book not only by the
cover but also with the content. This is one book that can break don't determine book by its cover, so do you
still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so
why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Gayle Anderson:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Holograms: A Cultural
History can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending your
free time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have
than the others?

Jesse Kennedy:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source which filled update of news. In
this particular modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking
the Holograms: A Cultural History when you essential it?
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